
Murcia Spring Week

Springtime in Murcia, Spain, is a vibrant tapestry woven with colorful traditions, joyful
celebrations, and a deep-rooted sense of community. As the flowers bloom and the
temperatures rise, the region comes alive with a series of captivating festivals that capture
the essence of Spanish culture. Let's embark on a journey to explore these lively and
enchanting springtime celebrations.

Holy Week/Semana Santa:
Like many parts of Spain, Murcia has Easter processions but what makes Murcia so special
is the addition of the incredible life-like statues by Francisco Salzillo, one of the greatest
Spanish baroque sculptors.

Bando de la Huerta:
Kicking off the spring festival season with exuberance and flair is the Bando de la Huerta.
The origin of this festival dates back to 1851, and from my understanding, a day to honour
the “huertano”. It was declared a Festival of International Tourist Interest in 2012 and is a
celebration of countryside traditions, which are deeply connected to the history of this city.
This beloved event, typically held on the Tuesday following Easter Sunday, transforms the
streets of Murcia into a bustling spectacle of music, dance, and gastronomy. Locals and
visitors alike don traditional huertano attire, characterized by colorful dresses and
chalecos/waistcoats, as they parade through the city, showcasing Murcia's agricultural
heritage. The aroma of freshly prepared local delicacies fills the air, tempting taste buds with
specialties like zarangollo (a traditional vegetable dish) and pastel de carne (meat pie). Live
music and dancing add to the festive atmosphere, making it a joyous celebration for all. It’s
literally one big party in the streets of the city and not something to miss out on if you’re in
the area.
Highlights of Bando: Paparajotes, the huertano parade, parties in the street, the huertano
outfits

Entierro de la Sardina:
The Burial of the Sardine festival is also one of the main events of the Murcia Spring
Festival. It consists of a parade with a giant papier-mâché sardine, representing the end of
the festival and the beginning of spring. The sardine is accompanied by floats and it’s
basically a fantastic show with music and entertainment. During the parade, thousands of
toys are handed out from the floats to children. At the end of the evening it is set alight like a
bonfire and crowds of people at the town square wait to see this momentous occasion,
followed by fireworks and party vibes.
Highlights of Entierro: The toy parade, the burning of the sardine, the fireworks

These are only two of the main activities during the Spring Festival Week in Murcia, but
there is so much more on offer. You can also enjoy workshops, exhibitions, theatre shows
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and other fun activities. It is a long-awaited celebration for the people of Murcia, and an
unforgettable experience for those who visit for the first time.

That’s it for today everyone, head on over to Murcia and maybe I’ll see you in the festivities.
🙂
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